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Herbicide 
For weed control" "" rail­
road rlghts-of-wa) and 
Industrial sit .. 

/f1{ 

Active Ingredients: 
2.4-bis (isopropyl­
amino)-6-
methoxy-s-
triazine .. 22.8% 
Pentachloro-
phenol ....... 8.6% 
Other Chloro­
phenols and 
related 
compounds ... 1.0% 
Inert Ingredients: 
Total: 

32.4% 

67.6% 
100.0% 

EPA Reg. No. 100-520 

Y'Jarning: 
Keep out of reach of 
chi/dren. 
Harmful if swallowed. Avoid contact with 
eyes and skin. Harmful if absorbed 
through skin. In case 01 skin contact. 
wash with soap and water Avoid inhala­
hon of spray mist. Avoid contamination 
of lood and feed. Do not get on clot!'i"9· 
Wash thoroughly after handling. 

Do not use or store near heat or open 
tlilme. 

Store at temperatures above 32" F 

Precautionary Statement: 
Do not conlaminale waler used for ""ga­
lion or domestic purpos('s Do not slore 
near lertillzers. se('ds. insecticidos or 
lunglcides Thoroughlv clean equipment 
wilh a suitable cleaner belore uSing for 
other purposes. 

Fish and Wildlife Caullon: 
This product is toxic to fish and wlld"'e 
Bnds and olher wildlife on trealed areas 
may be killed. Keep out 01 lakes. streams 
or ponds. Do not contaminate water by 
cleaning of equipment or disposal of 
wastes. 

-
DIRECTIONS FOR USE AND CONDI. 
TIONS OF SALE AND WARRANTY 

IMPORTANT: Read the entire Directions 
For U .. and the CondltloM Of Sale And 
Warren" belore USing this product. 

Condillon, Of Sale And Warran" 

The Dlrecllon, For U .. of this product 
reflect the opinion 01 experts based on 
field use and tests. The directions are 
believed to be reliable and should be 
followed carefully. However. it is impos­
sible to eliminate all ri5k' inherently 
associated with use of this product. Crop 
injury. ineffectiveness or other unin­
tended consequences may result be­
cause 01 such lactors as wealher condi­
tions. presence 01 other malerials. or the 
manner 01 use or applicalion all 01 which 
are beyond the control of Geigy or the 
Seller. All such risks shall be assumed 
by the Buyer. 

Geigy warrants that this product con­
forms to the chemical desc"ption on the 
label and is reasonably lit for the pur­
poses relerred :0 in the Direction, For 
Use. subject to the inherent risks re­
ferred to above. Geigy makes no other 
express or Implied warranty 01 Fitness or 
Merchantability or any other exprass or 
Implied warranty. In no case shall Geigy 
or the Seiler be liable for consequential. 
special or indirect damages reSulting 
from the use or handling of thiS product 
Geigy and the Seller oller thiS product. 
and the Buyer and user accept It. sublect 
to the foregoing Condition. 01 Sale And 
Warranty which may be varied only by 
agreeml'nt in writing signed by a duly 
authorized representative of GeIgy. 

Dlrecllon, For Use -----

AJ'ply 5-30 gallons of Ontrack WE~~'!. 
~inlmum of 50 gallons of water per .<Jcre 
as 11 pre-emergence or post~e~ergence 
treatment Use the lower rate to control 
annual and susceptible perennial weeds 
(SUCh as downy bromegrass oatg'85s. 
goosearass. guackgrass. I!unclu,evine. 
~emQd and plantain). Use the higher 
rilte to control hard-to-kill perennial 
weeds and grasses (such as J!l.hns!1n­
grass, bindw~ed ilnd wj!lll;arrot). 

.Do,n..?t ~p11 to area~derlaid br.!.oots 
of desirable trees and shrubs AVOid 
ij!ray drift to desira!1le p'lanls, ~. . 
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